

**Northwest-Shoals Community College Bid Awards
October 1, 2016 - September 30, 2017**

Bid Number	Description of Bid	Date Opened	Awarded To	Total Amount	Minority Information
2017-01	HVAC Services	October 18, 2016	J. K. Johnson	Year 1: \$6,750.00 Year 2: \$6,987.00 Year 3: \$7,235.00	
2017-02	Waste Management Services	November 17, 2016	Franklin Co. Solid Waste - PC Campus Republic Services - Shoals Campus	\$440.00 per month \$756.89 per month	
2017-03	Lawn Service	November 8, 2016	Coldwater Lawn Care	9 month - \$2,150.00 12 month - \$1,995.00	
2017-04	Jet Lathe Machine (PC Campus)	November 8, 2016		- No Bid -	
2017-05	Vertical Milling Machine (PC Campus)	November 8, 2016		- No Bid -	
2017-06	Motoman Robotics Cell	November 8, 2016	Southern Educational Systems	\$ 41,295.00	
2017-07	Belt Sander	November 17, 2016	Redmond Machinery	\$ 16,095.00	
2017-08	Adult Simulator	November 17, 2016		Did not meet the bid specifications Re-Bid	
2017-09	Female Adult Simulator	November 17, 2016		Did not meet the bid specifications Re-Bid	
2017-10	Miller LiveArc Welding Performance Management System	November 18, 2016	Airgas South	\$ 96,260.00	
2017-11	Plasma Cutting System	November 18, 2016	Red-D-Arc	\$ 177,600.00	
2017-12	Virtual Lab	November 21, 2016		- No Bid -	
2017-13	Jet Lathe Machine - PC Campus (RE-BID)	January 10, 2017		- No Bid -	
2017-14	Vertical Milling Machine - PC Campus (RE-BID)	January 10, 2017		- No Bid -	
2017-15	Printing of Class Schedules & College Catalogs	January 5, 2017	Vendors Awarded:		
			Publications Press, Inc.	\$ 9,582.00	
			Publications Press, Inc.	\$ 7,202.00	
2017-16	College Printed Materials & Copying Paper	December 13, 2016	Vendors Awarded:		
			Athens Paper	\$ 1,317.08	
			Color Xpress	\$ 3,612.00	
			Printers & Stationers, Inc.	\$ 1,817.00	
2017-17	Virtual Lab (Re-Bid)	December 15, 2016		- No Bid -	
2017-18	Male Adult Simulator (Re-Bid)	December 20, 2016	CAE Healthcare	\$ 57,568.76	

**Northwest-Shoals Community College Bid Awards
October 1, 2016 - September 30, 2017**

Bid Number	Description of Bid	Date Opened	Awarded To	Total Amount	Minority Information
2017-19	Female Adult Simulator (Re-Bid)	December 20, 2016	CAE Healthcare	\$ 55,890.00	
2017-20	Virtual Lab (Re-Bid) Virtual Lab (Re-Bid Extended)	January 5, 2017 January 24, 2017		- No Bid -	
2017-21	Jet Lathe Machine - PC Campus	January 26, 2017	Young Welding Supply	\$ 17,275.90	18% Woman Owned 7 1/2% Native American
2017-22	Vertical Milling Machine - PC Campus	January 26, 2017	Young Welding Supply	\$ 22,098.00	18% Woman Owned 7 1/2% Native American
2017-23	Master Tool Sets - Quantity Two (2)	March 23, 2017	Snap-On Industrial	\$ 23,198.00	
2017-24	Upward Bound Summer Transportation (PC Campus)	April 6, 2017	First Student	\$ 18,360.00	
2017-25	Upward Bound Summer Transportation (Shoals Campus)	April 6/2017	First Student	\$ 10,197.00	
2017-26	Upward Bound Trip - Chicago, IL (PC Campus)	April 11, 2017	Southern Leisure Tours	\$ 21,840.00	
2017-27	Upward Bound Trip - Memphis, TN (PC Campus)	April 11, 2017	Southern Leisure Tours	\$ 7,737.00	
2017-28	Upward Bound Trip - Orlando, FL (Shoals Campus)	April 13, 2017	Southern Leisure Tours	\$ 16,812.00	
2017-29	Auto Mechanics Tools	May 11, 2017	Snap-On Industrial	\$ 48,734.12	
2017-30	Advanced PLC Training System	June 1, 2017	Technical Lab Solutions, LLC	\$ 30,330.15	
2017-31	Upward Bound Trip - Nashville, TN (Shoals Campus)	June 22, 2017	Southern Leisure Tours	\$ 3,780.00	
2017-32	VRTEX Mobile Training System	August 3, 2017	Lincoln Electric	\$ 36,144.00	
2017-33	College Fleet Auto Insurance	September 14, 2017	Elliott & Associates Insurance	\$ 16,457.12	
2017-34	College Printed Materials & Copying Paper	September 14, 2017	Vendors Awarded:		
			Athens Paper	\$ 1,384.24	
			Color Xpress	\$ 4,212.00	
			Superior Print	\$ 694.80	100 % Woman Owned
2017-35	Carpentry/Cabinetmaking Materials & Supplies	September 14, 2017		- No Bid -	
2017-36	Consumables for Welding Department	September 21, 2017	Vendors Awarded:		
			Airgas South	\$ 350.56	

**Northwest-Shoals Community College Bid Awards
October 1, 2016 - September 30, 2017**

Bid Number	Description of Bid	Date Opened	Awarded To	Total Amount	Minority Information
			Young Welding Supply	\$ 402.19	
2017-37	Metals for Welding Department	September 21, 2017	Tri-State Metals, Inc.	\$ 21,957.37	
2017-38	Gases for Welding Department	September 21, 2017	Airgas South	See Bid Tab Below for Per Line Items Awarded	
2017-39	Line Burner with Plasma Machine Pipe Coupon Cutter/Bevel Cut & Straight Cut w/ Plasma Machine	August 31, 2017	Young Welding Supply	\$ 12,495.00	
RFP 2017-01	Armed Campus Security Services	December 6, 2016	G4S Secure Solutions	\$ 245,410.56	
RFP 2017-02	Cafeteria Services	July 18, 2017		- No Bid -	
Prepared by: Tammy Gresham, September 25, 2017					

Comments
Three-Year Contract Oct. 1, 2016 to Sept. 30, 2019
Two-Years and Ten Months Contract Dec. 1, 2016 to Sept. 30, 2019
One-Year and Eleven Months Contract November 14, 2016 to Sept. 30, 2018
Six-Month Contract
Six-Month Contract
Six-Month Contract
Six-Month Contract
Six-Month Contract
Six-Month Contract
Six-Month Contract
Six-Month Contract
Six-Month Contract
Six-Month Contract 2 machines @ \$48,130.00 each
Six-Month Contract
Six-Month Contract
Six-Month Contract
Six-Month Contract
Six-Month Contract
One-Year Contract January 1, 2017 to December 31, 2017 Awarded - Class Schedules Awarded - College Catalogs
Nine Month Contract January 1, 2017 - Sept. 30, 2017 Awarded - Printing of White & Color Paper Awarded - Printing of B & W Envelopes Awarded - Printing of Color Letterhead & Color Envelopes
Six-Month Contract
Six-Month Contract

Comments
Six-Month Contract
Six-Month Contract
Six-Month Contract
Six-Month Contract
Six-Month Contract
Six-Month Contract
Six-Month Contract
Six-Month Contract
Six-Month Contract
Six-Month Contract
Six-Month Contract
Six-Month Contract
Six-Month Contract
Six-Month Contract
Six-Month Contract
Six-Month Contract
Six-Month Contract
Three-Year Contract w/option to renew Two-Years at One year increments October 1, 2017 to September 30, 2020
One-Year Contract October 1, 2017 to September 30, 2018
Awarded - Copying Paper
Awarded - Printing of Color Envelopes, B & W Envelopes
Awarded - Printing of Color Letterhead
One-Year Contract October 1, 2017 to September 30, 2018
One-Year Contract w/option to renew for One-Year upon agreement of both parties. October 1, 2017 to September 30, 2018
Bid Awarded Per Line Item

Comments
Bid Awarded Per Line Item
One-Year Contract October 1, 2017 to September 30, 2018
One-Year Bid w/option to renew for One-Year upon agreement of both parties. October 1, 2017 to September 30, 2018
Six-Month Contract
Three-Year Contract June 1, 2017 to May 31, 2020
Three-Year Contract August 1, 2017 to July 31, 2020